Tt 9. € e~ 33004/99

REGD. No. D. L.-33004/99

Che Gazette of India

1.5, -TH.T.-31.-05062026-27 3181
CG-M H-E-05062026-273181

HTETIT
EXTRAORDINARY

AW 1 1—9Eve 4
PART Il1—Section 4

grfee ¥ TFfaT
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

g. 381]
No. 381]

T2 faeeht, AT, [ 5, 2026/59%5 15, 1948
NEW DELHI, FRIDAY, JUNE 5, 2026/JYAISTHA 15, 1948

AT R §F
(Farsfy wa fawm)
(T )
arferge
Hqa<, 5 5, 2026

farceft ot werer (Wt Sf< Farent #1 [ata) (o genee) RfRaaTasty, 2026

BT, &. HAT.23(AX)/(8)/2026-3Telt.— Farzeft wat warer srfarfa=sr, 1999 (1999 =T 42) #it & 7,
#TET 8 SiIY &TeT 47 ¥ IT-LTT (2), FTT T &R T RN F4d g0 Areeag e & vagrer Heeft qar
J9g (AT A "arst wr AaTg) AR, 2015 [fRAiR 12 SHERr 2016 # sAfeeEer

. AT 23(3M7)/2015-3], (P =8 wama ‘g At =mmeety #2777 ¢), § Mefererd gemas #:3ar &,

ERIGE

N

4044 G1/2026

)



2 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART I1I—SEC.4]

1. | AT 3T IT-

() == FfFwTeEeht #r et qar &g (ATer siw qarst w1 Fata) (v geree) EfRaameEt, 2026 w7
ST
(i) =g FErfFaTaet T TS § SEF Y9 6T are § 9N 2R

2. Rafaa 9 & gy

T farfewmeet § faffaw 9 3 -

(i) ST-FafFae (1) ® 'Iog AL 9Teal €9 9¢ A7 Agi+ 968 JiaeqTiaa - Sruan

(i) IT-FafF=m (2), @2 (F) ®, 'I5g Hald' &l & €79 9T AT Hgiv’ orex aedTiod oy ST

Afee . 7, Sy e

[F=Tae-111/4/378T./151/2026-27]

uT feoqoft: g7 RfRFaTEet I 93 & TR TSToT- STETLR — IT-11, g 3, 37-ave (i)
&A1 12.01.2016-ST0EsM 63T 19 (), | THTird &if T off o =5 918 § Ferqar
RN CREAUE

i. Sfrossme e 635 (3) R 23.06.2017

ii. AT 23(R)/(2)/2019-31e =i 03 fawaw 2019

iii. AT 23(R)/(3)/2020-317=T {31 31 919 2020

iv. AT 23(R)/(4)/2021 -3 faei 08 Sar 2021

v. AT 23(R)/(5)/2021-3m¥et fE=Te 08 f&rda< 2021

vi. AT 23(R)/(6)/2025-37=T fad 24 I 2025

vii. BT 23(R)/(7)/2025-34T faAi® 13 799¥ 2025



https://www.rbi.org.in/hindi/Scripts/Notifications.aspx?Id=6452&Mode=0
https://www.rbi.org.in/hindi/Scripts/Notifications.aspx?Id=6529&Mode=0
https://www.rbi.org.in/hindi/Scripts/Notifications.aspx?Id=6697&Mode=0
https://www.rbi.org.in/hindi/Scripts/Notifications.aspx?Id=6863
https://www.rbi.org.in/hindi/Scripts/Notifications.aspx?Id=6863
https://www.rbi.org.in/hindi/Scripts/Notifications.aspx?Id=6863

[9TT HH—=vE 4] T T TSI © T 3

RESERVE BANK OF INDIA
(Foreign Exchange Department)
(CENTRAL OFFICE)
NOTIFICATION
Mumbai, the 5th June, 2026
Foreign Exchange Management (Export of Goods and Services) (First Amendment) Regulations, 2026

F. No. FEMA 23(R)/(8)/2026-RB.— In exercise of the powers conferred by Section 7, Section 8 and
sub-section (2) of section 47 of the Foreign Exchange Management Act, 1999 (42 of 1999), the Reserve Bank of India
makes the following amendments to the Foreign Exchange Management (Export of Goods & Services) Regulations,
2015 [Notification No. FEMA 23(R)/2015-RB dated January 12, 2016] (hereinafter referred to as 'the Principal
Regulations'), namely:

1. Short Title and Commencement:-

(i)  These regulations may be called the Foreign Exchange Management (Export of Goods and Services) (First
Amendment) Regulations, 2026

(if)  They shall come into force from the date of their publication in the Official Gazette.
2. Amendment to Regulation 9:
In the principal regulations, in regulation 9 -
(i) in sub-regulation (1) for the words ‘fifteen months’, the words ‘nine months’ shall be substituted.

(if) in sub-regulation (2), in clause (a) for the words ‘fifteen months’, the words ‘nine months’ shall be substituted.

ROHIT P. DAS, Regional Director
[ADVT .-111/4/Exty./151/2026-27]

Foot Note.-The Principal Regulations were Published in the Official Gazette of Government of India — Extraordinary —
Part-11, Section 3, Sub-Section (i) dated 12.01.2016- G.S.R.N0.19(E) and subsequently amended vide the
following, namely as under:-

i. G.S.R.No. 635(E) dated 23.06.2017

ii. FEMA 23(R)/(2)/2019-RB dated December 03, 2019
iii. FEMA 23(R)/(3)/2020-RB dated March 31, 2020

iv. FEMA 23(R)/(4)/2021-RB dated January 08, 2021

v. FEMA 23(R)/(5)/2021-RB dated September 08, 2021
vi. FEMA 23(R)/(6)/2025-RB dated June 24, 2025

vii. FEMA 23(R)/(7)/2025-RB dated November 13, 2025

Uploaded by Dte. of Printing at Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi- 110064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054. s mas s .




		2026-06-05T19:49:47+0530
	SARVESH KUMAR SRIVASTAVA




