TR &, §.ue.- 33004/99 REGD. No. D. L.-33004/99

R £ 5194
Che Gazette of India

1.5l -3.Te.-31.-29052026-272931
CG-DL-E-29052026-272931

ETITIOT
EXTRAORDINARY
AT | —gve 3—9-@ve (i)
PART I1—Section 3—Sub-section (ii)

TR & THTIAT
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

. 2591] < fIe=tl, qaaTE, 7 27, 2026/5ASS 6, 1948
No. 2591] NEW DELHI, WEDNESDAY, MAY 27, 2026/JYAISTHA 6, 1948

TN, 9 AR TAGTY qRAdT HATAT

g
e faeett, 27 w2, 2026

FT.3T. 2684(37).— TATFL (F2eqon) sTfefaae, 1986 (1986 FT 29) #it amer 3 it ITATT (3) FT
TET AEAT T TIRT F2d §U JAT AT T 6 TRTA T TATE 3T qF HATAT il SATEAAT, ST AT
* TSI, AATATOT, 90 ||, @< 3, Iq@< (i) ¥ "@ear wr.am 1533 (1), ae 14 fdeaw, 2006 T
STERTTT T T °fF, o 927 3 % ITULT (6) F TLqF 9T T 5 F G (M) F TEqH 6 Aa0T |, FEIT qLFTY,
TH AT AT FHHT GHAT gU, THSIH 6l TF TILT TATEL THIG ATHAT T o ST 3T
HEETT 3T ST it 1T T (S9ws qogise Gt & sreqer 3T gaeqi f qararer 12 GHea, 2026
T AT ST T T THATS SATHAT TTIHLOT JAT TS FqT AT oA Tha FATT 6 T
T, TATRAT, ST o T8 21, % o J@rdl § oY 39 Y= & T a3iawr, aq e Saarq 9aad
HATAT, AT TLAHTL o0l SATELAAT, ST AT o6 TS0, AATIT, 907 2, T 3, IUE< (i) H &7 FIL.
2590 (31), AT 13 S, 2023 FIXT THRTTAT 6f 5 ofT, § Foferfed derree Fedt g, Taid:-

6 ATAGAAT H,
(F) &7 2 |, " " oTeal F T U T a9 MY g g orex wiaeriua R S,
(@) G276 ¥, " a9 TR o T U T 99 MY ®g A" orex Fiaetiua R Sraan
[T, §. sMEU3-13/4/2022-310.111]

TS AUATA, T A1

3774 G1/2026 )



2 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(ii)]

feroqor:- et Srfag=mT Aa % TSI, SETAn, 9w I, €@ 3, 3w (i) # G Hr.ar. 2590 (3N), anra
13 A, 2023 FRT FaTAq &t w2 ofF, ST gw=ar Fwrar 2000 (), a2 9%, 2025 RT TerETq
Terree FoRaT

MINISTRY OF ENVIRONMENT, FOREST AND CLIMATE CHANGE
NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 27th May, 2026

S.0. 2684(E).— In exercise of the powers conferred by sub-section (3) of section 3 of the
Environment (Protection) Act, 1986 (29 of 1986) and in pursuance of the proviso to sub- paragraph (6) of
paragraph 3 and proviso to clause (c) of paragraph 5 of the notification of the Government of India in the
erstwhile Ministry of Environment and Forests, published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, Part II,
Section 3, Sub-section (ii), vide number S.O. 1533(E), dated the 14th September, 2006, the Central
Government considering it necessary and expedient, hereby extends the term of the Chairman and
Members of the State Level Environment Impact Assessment Authority, Mizoram and the term of the
Chairman and Members of the State Level Expert Appraisal Committee, Mizoram for a period up to the
12" December, 2026 or till the re-constitution of the State Level Environment Impact Assessment
Authority and the State Level Expert Appraisal Committee, as the case may be, whichever is earlier, and
for that purpose makes the following amendments in the notification of the Government of India in the
Ministry of Environment, Forests and Climate Change, published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary
Part Il, Section 3, Sub-section(ii), vide number S.0. 2590 (E), dated the 13" June,2023 namely:-

In the said notification,
(a) in paragraph 2, for the words “three years”, the words “three years and six months” shall be substituted;
(b) in paragraph 6, for the words “three years”, the words “three years and six months” shall be substituted.
[F.No. 1A3-13/4/2022-1A.111]
RAJAT AGARWAL, Jt. Secy.

Note: -The principal notification was published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, Part I, Section 3,
Sub-section (ii), vide number S.O. 2590(E), dated the 13th June, 2023 subsequently amended vide,
number S.O. 2000(E), dated the 2" May, 2025.

Uploaded by Dte. of Printing at Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi- 110064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054. & &




		2026-05-29T22:20:32+0530
	SARVESH KUMAR SRIVASTAVA




