TR &, §.ue.- 33004/99 REGD. No. D. L.-33004/99

Che Gazette of India

G1.5.-21.Te1.-31.-02042026-271524
CG-DL -E-02042026-271524

T
EXTRAORDINARY
AWM II—Evs 3—39-Tvs (ii)
PART II—Section 3—Sub-section (ii)

grfee ¥ THfAT
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

€. 1629 T3 fRetl, qaaTe, a3« 1, 2026/ 94 11, 1948
No. 1629] NEW DELHI, WEDNESDAY, APRIL 1, 2026/ CHAITRA 11, 1948

SN ECICE R E D)
srfeg=T
TE faeeT, 1 o7ier, 2026
FT.IMT. 1694(37).— FeT Y, AATagT Afa=aw, 1972 (1972 FT 69) FT &T=T 4% FT ITLTT (6)

BTT & TRl T ST X g0 ST I<h STTS A ol TTa<t ST & eq1g-3 o HIH 24 o FqEe H,
I ATATAAH F TTALTAT T AT H T@HL AT TH a7d & S g o [Ferdy gy denfed #f T i &
HIHTSA T TATEAT LA o (o7 TH SaeqF T GHIA T THAT gU, TAZRT 3 d 9T qg=T 7 28 faHay,
2024 5 g Aeferiad sraem 3t 8, Taid-

1. =W 21 9, 39-A99 (1) ¥, “TF A1 AT g 1S |l THH” U531 & T4 9T, “UF d19
THATAA ZATL TS |T STV QTeal T TET SITUIT;

2. Faw 229, -
(F) IT-FA=7 (1) ¥, "OT= AT A AT A" ea1 o T UL, "B g A1 |1 A" 9Teal
T TET STTUAT;
(@) 3U-F=H (2) #, ‘U AT T AT AZTEHL a1 & T U, “TF g T |1 IS4 M5l Fl
THT SATUT; 377

2389 GI/2026 (1)



2 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(ii)]

() 3T-T=w (3) |, "qT2H" 9151 * T U, "o 9" A% Kl TET SATUIT

[T, /. TET-11027/1/2025-T-UHAE U]
e : faTag sfafaam, 1972 & Tt Sqa=T & Fa| 21 37 22 # siqfas arfe @it w1 sfe==r
TEAT FT.41. 987 (), faeis 02 A=, 2020 gTeT uger §ff Ferrtera = 47 =m

MINISTRY OF CIVIL AVIATION
NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 1st April, 2026

S.0. 1694(E).— In exercise of the powers conferred by sub-section (6) of section 4A of the Carriage
by Air Act, 1972 (69 of 1972), and pursuant to rule 24 of Chapter III of the Third Schedule to the said Act, the
Central Government, having regard to the provisions of the said Act, and being satisfied that it is necessary
or expedient to give effect to the limits of liability as revised by the depository, hereby makes the following
provision in the said Third Schedule with effect from the 28™ December, 2024, namely:-

1. Inrule 21, in sub-rule (1), for the words "one lakh twenty- eight thousand eight hundred twenty-one
", the words " one lakh fifty-one thousand eight hundred eighty" shall be substituted;

2. Inrule 22, -

(a) in sub-rule (1), for the words " five thousand three hundred forty- six ", the words "six thousand
three hundred three" shall be substituted;

(b) in sub-rule (2), for the words " one thousand two hundred eighty- eight ", the words "one
thousand five hundred nineteen" shall be substituted; and

(c) in sub-rule (3), for the words " twenty-two ", the words "twenty-six" shall be substituted.
[F. No. AV-11027/1/2025-A-MOCA]
ASANGBA CHUBA AO, Jt. Secy.

Note : The liability limits contained in rules 21 and 22 of the Third Schedule to the Carriage by Air Act,
1972 were earlier revised vide notification number S.0. 987 (E), dated the 02" March, 2020.

Uploaded by Dte. of Printing at Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-110064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054.  GORAkHA

NATH YADAVA




		2026-04-02T16:06:22+0530
	GORAKHA NATH YADAVA




